BID TABULATION
BID NO: 250063
PRESCHOOL SUMMER TRANSPORTATION 2025
BASIS OF AWARD
Default bid group.
Description
Route 1 - Saranac Lake CSD
Route 2 - Minerva CSD
Route 3 - Schroon Lake CSD
Route 4 - Boquet Valley and Willsboro CSD
Route 5 - Crown Point, Moriah, & Ticonderoga CSD
No Show Fee

Quantity
1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00
1.00

Default bid group. SubTotal
Grand Total

Unit
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH
EACH

DUR

Unit Price

No Bid
$378.00000
$368.00000
No Bid
$688.00000
No Bid
$1,434.00000
$1,434.00000



RIN INC BLUELINE COMMUTER INC

Sub Total Unit Price Sub Total

No Bid $350.00000 $350.00

$378.00 No Bid No Bid
$368.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid

$688.00 No Bid No Bid

No Bid No Bid No Bid
$1,434.00 $350.00000 $350.00

$1,434.00 $350.00000 $350.00
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